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Time pressure is the feeling of not exactly having enough �me to complete a 
single task at the workplace.  Also, �me pressure is considered as one of the 
greatest sources, when we talk about job stress.  Recently, in a survey of 1,000 
employees, various yet frequent deadlines were iden�fied as the most general 
cause of work-related stress. Around 30% of employees followed the norms for 
reasons like physical demands, being responsible for the lives of others and 
compe��veness. 

When marking professions varying from teaching to nursing, the pressure dealing 
with deadline comes with high burnout and less job engagement. However, in a 
recent survey- over 1500 employees in Sweden stated that the differences felt 
related to �me or deadline- related pressure is responsible for only 5% of 
employees’ emo�onal health and well-being. Time pressure also has an adverse 
effect on performance. 

The employees feeling pressurized tend to invest less �me in promo�onal goals 
and adopt more avoidant sort of an a�tude. It was concluded in a series of lab 
research, performed by MBAs, who were working under huge pressure. The �me 
pressure created significantly less crea�ve proposals as compared to the ones 
working under no �me or deadline-related pressure. 

One of the most powerful solu�ons to the feelings of �me pressure is to ask for 
more �me to complete any task. Prior organiza�onal inves�ga�on on deadlines 
has treated the �meline as a fixed and non-adjustable condi�on and instead has 
been focused on how the employees are affected by these deadlines. Moreover, 
popular press ar�cles and our own recent cross-occupa�onal survey indicate that 
many deadlines in the workplace may be open for factors like adjustments. 

Deadlines are generally considered as a commitment device rather than due to an 
outright need to complete assigned work in a certain �meline. Also, in such cases, 
supervisors or employees themselves will set the deadline based on a subjec�ve 
es�ma�on of how much �me the task will take. So, according to a recent survey 



of paid employees- ranging from the warehouse staff to the developers – the 

deadlines were often happily adjusted: here, around 95% of individuals who 

requested their supervisors for an extension were granted one. Additionally, 60% 

of the employees reported that the deadline for the task that they recently asked 

an extension for was set based on choices or let’s say preferences of their 

supervisors, team heads or clients that were a little difficult to adjust. 

The extension requests might be a powerful means to adjust timeline and related-

pressure to improve the quality of work. Also, in another research, it was stated 

evidence that in spite of the deadline extension, many individuals often abstain 

from establishing timely communication in terms of their adjustment. However, 

they end up choosing to suffer under high timeline-related stress and provided 

the company with the suboptimal quality of work.  It was suggested that a key 

reason why the employees misspent their extension requests can be found in the 

relational nature of the deadline set in the workplace. Particularly, it was 

concluded that employees avoid requesting for more time because they tend to 

believe that asking for more time can harm their working-abilities in front of their 

supervisors. Furthermore, these beliefs are misguided: supervisors do not 

perceive individuals, who ask for more time as ineffectual, and employees are 

failing to drive the various benefits of extension request even when their costs are 

marginal. 

Impression Management and Evaluation in the Office 

Many individuals persistently drew conclusions about the others’ peculiarity from 

their action. Indeed, countless information, material, and social outcomes depend 

on the impressions we all make on others. Talking about the workplace, for 

instance, the team leads to evaluate the performance of the same employee as 

higher quality in case they have a positive impression of the same. Such 

evaluations, in turn, affect important workplace rewards like promotions, 

consequent task assignments, and appraisals. 

Team heads are more likely to recommend rewards for individuals they perceive 

to be highly motivated. Here, the employee’s personal beliefs in terms of traits 

their actions signal to others that drive or hinder their performance in the 



workplace.  For example, employees are most likely to help other people at work 

when their behavior is conspicuous and when an appraisal is near because in such 

a case they believe that having a helping behavior can highlight their value as a 

helpful member of the company. 

Decisions to involve in certain actions in the workplace are considered as a 

balancing act, where employees must consider the direct result of the act and 

what the behavior signals to others around them. So, when settling down on 

whether to seek feedback, for instance: employees never consider the value of 

the information that will them to enhance their skills and performance, but also 

what the feedback seeking behavior will signal to other individuals, including 

factors like incompetence or the motivation so as to perform well. 

According to recent research the impression management it has been suggested 

that this added layer of impression management can somehow impede 

employees from their behavior in terms of engagement that would otherwise 

improve their creativity and effectiveness at work. Also, a cross-occupational 

survey found that people who tend to harbor negative theories about accepting 

help from their co-employees (e.g. “when we help our co-employees to complete 

their task, our boss perceives us less proficient”) displayed lower levels of in-role 

job enactment and productivity according to their team heads or supervisors. 

Also, according to a field experiment, employees solving an experimental 

assignment avoided seeking hints from their designated advisors, especially when 

the hint requested could signal their accountability, even when the extra hints 

would have noticeably boosted their likelihood of victory.  On the other hand 

employees with low-performance, who otherwise would have required feedback, 

avoided seeking feedbacks when their feedback seeking was noticeable to others. 

Here, by not asking feedback, these employees were forgoing an invaluable 

possible resource for improving their productivity and other aspects.  Building on 

this research, the current research examines extension requests as an 

underexplored domain where such impressions are likely to hinder one’s 

efficiency and well-being at the office. However, the employees who are highly 

motivated will be more competent to their team heads, united with the 



interactive nature of deadline setting.  This may deter an employee from 

proactively adjusting their timelines even at the times when it benefits their well-

being and performance. 

Timeline Extension Request as an Indication of Inability 

The extension requests were defined as the act of asking for a little more time to 

finish work- relevant task. Here, the timeline extension and related requests may 

be seen as a type of employee voice- that is: 

• When coming up with suggestions and expressing their work preferences. 

• In ways that they are not really expected to, based on their professionally 

defined roles. 

• Having the potential to promote their and the company’s effectiveness. 

It has been explored that the antecedents and consequences of employees 

speaking up at the workplace. The prior research has recognized two main 

deterrents- when considering the VOICE of employees and they are: 

• First, individuals generally prefer to remain silent because they perceive 

“voice” to be relational and risky. People fear that by challenging a set 

practice within a company may highlight them as a complainer, lose respect 

or support from other employees, be Secondly assigned on some unwanted 

projects, or they can even be fired. 

• Secondly, employees do not speak up because they somehow believe their 

voice will be pointless. However, the cross-sectional analyzes and 

laboratory studies predict that managers often evaluate the employees 

who raise their voices as better performers and readily endorse their 

creativity and ideas. 

This happens when the manager had optimistic impressions of the employee 

earlier. In this paper, our main goal is to focus on the timeline extension requests 

where the following two factors are well-identified concerns behind their voice 

are at minimal. Particularly, the extension requests are created for: 

 Deadlines that can be adjusted. 



  Job assigned that are not interdependent. 

The employees’ negligence in terms of extension requests with a high likelihood 

of success and low expenses for the one who requested is both theoretically and 

practically worthy of examination. So, taking practical aspects into consideration- 

these are the requests that can effectively assuage the time-pressure with 

minimal personal and organizational expenses. Thus, having an in-depth 

understanding related to the obstacles against employees’ active use of these 

extension requests may help businesses to develop costless interventions to 

improve employee-related efficiencies.  Theoretically, by investigating these 

costless extension requests the employees can raise their voice in two ways, as 

mentioned above. 

Here, you must explore the goals and objectives of an understudied instantiation 

of the voice raised by the employee for extension requests. While on employee 

voice has explored a set of worker voice behavior that includes providing opinions 

regarding on-going projects, problem selling or no prior R&D execute the process. 

Thus, the work expands the taxonomy of the worker’s voice that has a fear of 

backlash or rejection, as a deterrent of extension requests. Here, the research 

tends to offer greater nuance for the areas of understanding of the motives 

behind the employees’ speaking up. The extending aforementioned studies on 

the impression management in the workplace, it was predicted that when the 

impression and concerns are high that is the extension request is visible to the 

users who will evaluate and appreciate them. The employees will automatically 

avoid asking them for more time even when the costs of the extension and 

related requests that allows you to identify perceived impression related costs, 

independent from other well-established problems against the workers voice like 

fear of criticism or rejection, as a unique deterrent of the timeline extensions. 

Therefore, here is the greater nuance for the understanding of the field along 

with the motives behind the employees’ speaking up.  Also, it is predicted that 

when impression concerns are high, the employees will avoid asking for more 

time even when the costs of the extension request are minimal and the potential 

benefits are quite high. Furthermore, employees do not make extension requests 



just because they are primarily concerned with seeming ineffectual.  The 

widespread orientation towards efficiency, especially where employees are likely 

to believe that extension requests lead to the discernment of ineffectiveness by 

their team heads and co-employee. Indeed, working under an accelerated pace, 

the employees generally view time as one of the valuable resources which they 

should in actual guard, protect and hoard. 

Remember, employees’ value the productive use of time that even when 

selecting leisure activities, they willingly opt to engage in novel, extreme activities 

that permit them to feel productive at the expense of contentment.  To be more 

precise in the work domain “Good Time Management” and related skills are 

identified by the team heads and unlike peers as one of the most basic skill set f 

the top performers. Based on a number of observations, it was suggested that 

when having to ask for an extension on a given task, employees can fear that they 

are demonstrating their incompetence to use their time effectively. 

So, overestimating impression cost of extension requests and emotional 

perspective- taking, or predicting how another person will respond to a certain 

scenario that one is not currently in, can be very difficult. Here, predicting how 

someone’s behavior influences the judgments of others is a type of perspective 

taking that we are specifically in adept at.  The most considerable problem of 

predicting someone else’s state of mind, when predicting their judgments of 

other employees, our judgments are further clouded by self-enhancement 

motives and egocentric. In such a case even if an employee cares a little deeper 

about accurately making perceptions about others and their reaction, rather than 

observing themselves in a flattering light, the opportunity here is to receive 

feedback and calibrate predictions of someone are a little rare. 

This is because people can directly express their judgments socially towards each 

other may be due to politeness or any other reason. Thus, the impression 

management strategies are generally misguided based on the incorrect 

predictions of how others will react to someone else’s actions. For instance, many 

people may avoid sharing their failures or mistakes, just because they believe that 

the observers will somehow judge them as inefficient or unintelligent for their 



mistakes related to task performance than is actually the case. Here, the 

workplace, employees tend to avoid seek advice as well because they believe it 

will signal incompetence. Moreover, in a series of studies, the advice providers 

somehow perceived the ones who needed their advice as more efficient than the 

ones who did not. 

Employees tend to refrain from asking for help at work, nervous that they will 

look inefficiently to others. Yet, in a cross-occupation survey, team heads’ 

frequency of having helped an individual positively connected meta-perceptions 

about inabilities are particularly noteworthy for the current examination. 

Firstly the employee tends to anchor on their own perceptions when predicting 

the judgments of others, for instance:  the one who is forced to admit their own 

shortcomings due to their mistakes, requests, helping requests and more can 

somehow project their own frustration when predicting someone else’s reaction. 

Here, as a result, they tend to overestimate how disappointed others can be. 

Secondly, people can suffer from vocalism. 

Focusing a little narrowly on the impact of the focal act instead of broader 

context, for example, the deadlines are flexible. In such a case of extension 

requests, the employees who imagine failing to succeed in the goal of finishing a 

task at intervals a given point is also thwarted in themselves and expect that their 

supervisors can share this sentiment. Staff may additionally focus an excessive 

amount of on their extension requests and neglect the broader relevant context 

that the supervisors also take into thought in deciding the employee’s capability, 

like the adjustability of the point, employee’s work ethic throughout previous 

interactions, or the standard of their performance output. Building on the meta-

perception literature, we tend to predict that staff can overestimate however 

incompetent supervisors will understand them to be after they raise to regulate 

the point, because of such anchoring on self-perception and neglecting the 

broader context. 

Underestimating the advantages of Extensions 



Apart from overestimating the impression prices, staff may additionally avoid 

requesting longer as a result of the underestimate its edges. From honest, 

constructive communication to social interactions with weak ties—such as a 

Starbucks barista, people avoid numerous social interactions not solely as a result 

of they are unable to predict others’ negative responses however conjointly 

because they fail to predict their own positive reactions to those future events. 

within the case of extension requests, even once a worker is definite they're going 

to probably receive an extension, they may believe that requesting longer is futile 

as a result of they undervalue what proportion the progressive extension could 

facilitate them feel less stressed and will enhance their work quality. As a result, 

they will feel less intended to produce longer. 

Conclusion 

Time shortage could be a serious issue within the geographical point, harming 

worker well-being and performance. One potential resolution to time deficiency, 

that workers underutilize, is extension requests. During this paper, we tend to 

port multiple experiments exploring why workers are reluctant to invite longer 

and what they will be rejected as a result. Our findings indicate that workers 

could avoid inquiring for longer as a result of they believe asking for more time 

may signal their incompetence to the parties whose analysis is significant to them. 

Further, we discover that employee’s worry that extension requests would value 

their image is exaggerated, which supervisors don't understand workers who 

invite less competent. Rather supervisors could understand extension requests as 

a symptom of employee’s motivation. Gaining longer may offer workers the 

chance to enhance their performance and the way competent they appear to 

their supervisors. Taken alone, our findings recommend that staff ought to 

actively invite longer to their supervisors whenever necessary so as to extend 

their effectiveness at work 


